
ÖSTERSUND MONDAY, APRIL 24

RACE 1, V4-1 Auto 1640

1 Brageson won eight races last year and climbed quickly
through the classes. He prefers to run in front over the short
distance, and this number is perfect. 4 Hauk Viktor made a
move with 700 meters to go last time and won convincingly.
With driver Björn Goop now up, he is a contender. 7 Fjasko
showed his great capacity last time as he finished second in
record time. Looking for new heights and a good option behind
the favorite. 3 Haga Modde is up and down, but at his best, he
has the speed to compete in this class. He likes the short
distance. Outsider.

RANK
A: 1

B: 4-7-3-10-9-5-11-8-6

C: 2-12

Top 4: 1-4-7-3

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 4, 7
U-Horses: 1
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 1
2: 3, 4, 7
3: 3, 4, 5, 7, 9, 10
Total: 15 x 2 = 30

RACE 2, V4-2 Volt 2140

3 T.C.Mikita has been fast and uncomplicated, and led all the
way two starts back. Was also good from the front last time but
got defeated by a strong rival. 7 Big Success is a hot contender
with two improved performances recently. Has been ill after the
last start though and the form is a question mark. 13 From a Box
has raced better after a pause and was brave after a tough
journey in the last run. Possible despite a difficult starting
position. 4 Adele Gel may benefit from her starting position and
follow our favorite. She has shown promising form.

RANK
A: 3

B: 7-13-4-6-11-12-5-2

C: 8-14-10-1-9

Top 4: 3-7-13-4

Quinella:
Horses: 4, 6, 7, 13
U-Horses: 3
Total: 4 x 10 = 40

Trifecta:
1: 3
2: 4, 6, 7, 13
3: 4, 6, 7, 13
Total: 12 x 2 = 24



ÖSTERSUND MONDAY, APRIL 24

RACE 3, V4-3 Volt 1640

7 Global Crusader scored several impressive wins last year and
is the kind of horse that will be competing in the V75 in the
future. Seasonal debut now and should have top chance. 2
Florence Ima has been unlucky and got locked in on several
occasions. Looks good and is better than recent results suggest.
1 Kontur usually performs well when in the lead. Has finally got
a good starting position and the distance is the right one. 8
Mellby Galanga has been more consistent lately, which has led
to success. Early contender in this race.

RANK
A: 7

B: 2-1-8-9-11

C: 3-4-6-5-10

Top 4: 7-2-1-8

Quinella:
Horses: 1, 2, 8, 9, 11
U-Horses: 7
Total: 5 x 10 = 50

Trifecta:
1: 7
2: 1, 2, 8, 9, 11
3: 1, 2, 8, 9, 11
Total: 20 x 2 = 40

RACE 4, V4-4, V5-1 Auto 2140

8 Ektara hasn't won yet but has been on the podium in seven
out of 14 races. She has the right attitude and faces suitable
opposition to achieve her first win today. 6 Be Sober showed
some speed last year and the four-year-old now comes from a
debut that promises more. On the way up and will challenge the
favorite. 4 One for the Money is fast and interesting with this
number behind the gate. Jomar Blekkan is an advantage too. 2
Mayfly Sock looked good last time and with shorter intervals
between races now, we believe in even more improvement. Fast.

RANK
A: 8-6

B: 4-2-5-1-3-11-12-7

C: 9-10

Top 4: 8-6-4-2

Quinella:
Horses: 6, 8
Total: 1 x 10 = 10

Trifecta:
1: 6, 8
2: 6, 8
3: 2, 4, 5
Total: 6 x 2 = 12



ÖSTERSUND MONDAY, APRIL 24

RACE 5, V5-2 Auto 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 2

B: 9-4-6-10-5-3-8

C: 1-7

Top 4: 2-9-4-6

Quinella:
Horses: 4, 6, 9
U-Horses: 2
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 2
2: 4, 6, 9
3: 3, 4, 5, 6, 8, 9, 10
Total: 18 x 2 = 36

RACE 6, V5-3 Volt 1640

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 3-10-4

B: 5-13-8-6-7-1-12

C: 9-2-11

Top 4: 3-10-4-5

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 4, 10
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 3, 4, 10
2: 3, 4, 10
3: 3, 4, 5, 10, 13
Total: 18 x 2 = 36



ÖSTERSUND MONDAY, APRIL 24

RACE 7, V5-4 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 3-6

B: 1-7

C: 4-5-2

Top 4: 3-6-1-7

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 6
Total: 1 x 10 = 10

Trifecta:
1: 3, 6
2: 3, 6
3: 1, 7
Total: 4 x 2 = 8

RACE 8, V5-5 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 4

B: 8-2-1-5-6-3-7

C:

Top 4: 4-8-2-1

Quinella:
Horses: 1, 2, 8
U-Horses: 4
Total: 3 x 10 = 30
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